

Exhibit A

CONFIDENTIAL and WORK PRODUCT - JUSTIN MARQUEZ TIMESHEETS

Date:	Hours:	Task Code	Description	Case	Atty	Case Total:	Task Code Cumulative Total
03/18/19	0.3	L110	Review intake information	Pretium Packaging	JM	0.3	0.3
03/18/19	0.5	L110	Research defendant and prior lawsuits.	Pretium Packaging	JM	0.8	0.8
03/18/19	0.2	L110	E-mails re: intake information.	Pretium Packaging	JM	1.0	1
03/19/19	0.2	L110	E-mails re: signing up client.	Pretium Packaging	JM	1.2	1.2
03/26/19	0.3	L110	Review client's documents.	Pretium Packaging	JM	1.5	1.5
03/27/19	0.1	L190	Review records request letter.	Pretium Packaging	JM	1.6	0.1
04/29/19	0.2	L190	E-mail re: status of records.	Pretium Packaging	JM	1.8	0.3
06/03/19	2.3	L120	Review personnel file and analyze time records.	Pretium Packaging	JM	4.1	2.3
06/03/19	0.4	L120	Research claims.	Pretium Packaging	JM	4.5	2.7
09/15/19	0.3	L120	Confer with Corey Kniss ("CK") re drafting complaint.	Pretium Packaging	JM	4.8	3
09/16/19	0.5	L210	Review and revise complaint.	Pretium Packaging	JM	5.3	0.5
09/26/19	0.3	L210	Review and revise PAGA letter.	Pretium Packaging	JM	5.6	0.8
11/26/19	0.2	L210	E-mails re complaint filing.	Pretium Packaging	JM	5.8	1
12/18/19	0.2	L200	Conference call with opposing counsel ("OC") re: responsive pleading.	Pretium Packaging	JM	6.0	0.2
12/18/19	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: responsive pleading.	Pretium Packaging	JM	6.1	0.3
12/30/19	0.2	L200	Review stipulation drafted by OC and respond to e-mail re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	6.3	0.5
01/07/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: motion to dismiss.	Pretium Packaging	JM	6.4	0.6
01/07/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: deadline to move to dismiss.	Pretium Packaging	JM	6.5	0.7
01/08/20	0.1	L200	E-mail to Min Jee Kim ("MJK") re: conference call.	Pretium Packaging	JM	6.6	0.8
01/10/20	3.0	L210	Research re: opposing motion to dismiss	Pretium Packaging	JM	9.6	4
01/10/20	2.5	L210	Review removal papers and research remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	12.1	6.5
01/13/20	0.6	L200	Review file to prepare for conference call with OC re: motion to dismiss.	Pretium Packaging	JM	12.7	1.4
01/13/20	0.2	L200	E-mails to OC re: rescheduling conference call.	Pretium Packaging	JM	12.9	1.6
01/13/20	0.3	L200	Conference call with OC re: motion to dismiss.	Pretium Packaging	JM	13.2	1.9
01/14/20	1.8	L210	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: motion to dismiss and motion to remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	15.0	8.3
01/15/20	0.3	L210	Call with expert re: declaration ISO motion to remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	15.3	8.6
01/16/20	5.0	L210	Research and draft motion to remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	20.3	13.6
01/23/20	0.8	L210	Review expert's declaration ISO motion to remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	21.1	14.4
01/25/20	0.2	L210	E-mail expert re: declaration.	Pretium Packaging	JM	21.3	14.6
01/25/20	2.4	L210	Continue drafting motion to remand, including incorporating expert's declaration.	Pretium Packaging	JM	23.7	17
01/27/20	0.8	L210	Review expert's revised declaration	Pretium Packaging	JM	24.5	17.8
01/27/20	0.1	L210	E-mail expert re: declaration.	Pretium Packaging	JM	24.6	17.9
01/27/20	2.5	L210	Finalize motion to remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	27.1	20.4
01/27/20	0.2	L210	E-mail MJK re: motion to remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	27.3	20.6
02/09/20	1.3	L210	Draft FAC.	Pretium Packaging	JM	28.6	21.9
02/09/20	0.1	L210	E-mail MJK re: FAC	Pretium Packaging	JM	28.7	22

02/09/20	0.2	L210	E-mail CK re: Joint Report and Initial Disclosures.	Pretium Packaging	JM	28.9	22.2
02/10/20	2.5	L210	Review opposition and research cases cited in opposition.	Pretium Packaging	JM	31.4	24.7
02/10/20	0.5	L210	E-mail additional research request to CK re: reply.	Pretium Packaging	JM	31.9	25.2
02/11/20	0.2	L210	E-mails re: reply ISO remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	32.1	25.4
02/12/20	4.8	L210	Draft reply ISO remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	36.9	30.2
02/13/20	0.2	L210	E-mails re: reply ISO remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	37.1	30.4
02/14/20	3.5	L210	Revise and finalize reply ISO remand.	Pretium Packaging	JM	40.6	33.9
02/18/20	0.5	L210	Revise Joint Report	Pretium Packaging	JM	41.1	34.4
02/18/20	0.2	L210	E-mail CK re: revisions to Joint Report	Pretium Packaging	JM	41.3	34.6
02/19/20	0.2	L200	Read and respond to OC's e-mail re: Def.'s motion to strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	41.5	2.1
02/19/20	0.3	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from CK re: Joint Report.	Pretium Packaging	JM	41.8	2.4
02/20/20	0.5	L200	Read e-mail from OC re: Def.'s motion to strike and research authorities cited in e-mail.	Pretium Packaging	JM	42.3	2.9
02/20/20	1.7	L200	Additional research re: Def.'s motion to strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	44.0	4.6
02/21/20	1.5	L200	Draft e-mail in response to Def.'s motion to strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	45.5	6.1
02/21/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: Def.'s motion to strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	45.6	6.2
02/21/20	0.3	L200	Finalize Joint Report and e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	45.9	6.5
02/24/20	0.6	L200	Revise Stipulation and Joint Report; e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	46.5	7.1
02/24/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: revisions to Joint Report.	Pretium Packaging	JM	46.6	7.2
02/24/20	0.1	L200	E-mail MJK re: filing	Pretium Packaging	JM	46.7	7.3
03/06/20	3.0	L210	Prepare for hearing on motion to remand and status conference.	Pretium Packaging	JM	49.7	37.6
03/08/20	2.5	L210	Prepare for hearing on motion to remand and status conference.	Pretium Packaging	JM	52.2	40.1
03/09/20	4.0	L210	Travel to and attend hearing for motion to remand and status conference.	Pretium Packaging	JM	56.2	44.1
03/12/20	0.2	L200	E-mail MJK re: calendaring deadlines for Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	56.4	7.5
03/12/20	2.6	L210	Review answer and research motion to strike answer.	Pretium Packaging	JM	59.0	46.7
03/12/20	0.4	L210	E-mail Rob Dart ("RD") instructions re: motion to strike answer.	Pretium Packaging	JM	59.4	47.1
03/12/20	2.2	L210	Review Def.'s Mot. to Strike; draft SAC in response.	Pretium Packaging	JM	61.6	49.3
03/12/20	0.2	L210	E-mail OC re: Def.'s Mot. To Strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	61.8	49.5
03/12/20	0.3	L300	E-mail MJK re: Initial Disclosures.	Pretium Packaging	JM	62.1	0.3
03/12/20	0.2	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	62.3	7.7
03/13/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: SAC	Pretium Packaging	JM	62.4	7.8
03/16/20	0.3	L200	Review OC's draft stipulation; e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	62.7	8.1
03/19/20	0.5	L300	Review and revise initial disclosures.	Pretium Packaging	JM	63.2	0.8
03/19/20	0.3	L200	Read and respond to e-mails from MJK re: initial disclosures.	Pretium Packaging	JM	63.5	8.4
03/27/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	63.6	8.5
04/06/20	0.8	L310	Review discovery requests.	Pretium Packaging	JM	64.4	0.8
04/07/20	0.2	L200	E-mails with OC re: SAC	Pretium Packaging	JM	64.6	8.7
04/09/20	0.2	L200	E-mails with OC re: SAC and stipulation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	64.8	8.9
04/10/20	0.5	L210	Draf stipulation and e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	65.3	50
05/04/20	0.3	L200	Review Answer; e-mail RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	65.6	9.2
05/08/20	0.1	L200	E-mail RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	65.7	9.3
05/11/20	0.2	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: Pl.'s Motion to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	65.9	9.5
05/12/20	0.8	L200	Review RD's memo re: motion to strike; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	66.7	10.3
05/12/20	0.2	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	66.9	10.5
05/12/20	0.4	L200	Conference call with OC re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	67.3	10.9

05/12/20	0.1	L200	Review and comment on RD's meet and confer e-mail.	Pretium Packaging	JM	67.4	11
05/15/20	0.5	L200	Read and respond to RD's e-mail re: OC's response to mot. to strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	67.9	11.5
05/15/20	0.1	L210	E-mail RD re: stipulation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.0	50.1
05/15/20	0.1	L210	Review and revise stipulation; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.1	50.2
05/15/20	0.1	L210	Review and revise updated stipulation; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.2	50.3
05/18/20	0.1	L210	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: stipulation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.3	50.4
05/18/20	0.2	L210	E-mails re: filing stipulation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.5	50.6
06/01/20	0.3	L200	Review and comment on RD's meet and confer e-mail.	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.8	11.8
06/03/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	68.9	11.9
06/08/20	0.8	L310	Review defendant's discovery responses.	Pretium Packaging	JM	69.7	1.6
06/09/20	1.5	L200	Research re: def.'s affirmative defenses.	Pretium Packaging	JM	71.2	13.4
06/09/20	0.5	L200	E-mail RD re: def.'s affirmative defenses.	Pretium Packaging	JM	71.7	13.9
06/09/20	0.7	L300	Revise protective order; e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	72.4	1.5
06/09/20	0.3	L200	L.R. 7-3 call with OC re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	72.7	14.2
06/10/20	0.3	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	73.0	14.5
06/10/20	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	73.1	14.6
06/10/20	0.5	L200	Instructions to RD re: what affirmative defenses to strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	73.6	15.1
06/10/20	0.2	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from RD re: Pl.'s Mot. to Strike	Pretium Packaging	JM	73.8	15.3
06/12/20	0.5	L310	Review Def.'s discovery responses; e-mail Rachel Vinson ("RV") re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	74.3	2.1
06/15/20	1.2	L210	Review and revise motion to strike; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	75.5	51.8
06/15/20	0.3	L210	E-mails re: motion to strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	75.8	52.1
06/15/20	0.8	L210	Review and finalize motion to strike.	Pretium Packaging	JM	76.6	52.9
06/24/20	0.6	L300	Review draft meet and confer letter re: Def.'s discovery responses; e-mail RV re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	77.2	2.1
06/25/20	0.2	L160	E-mail OC re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	77.4	0.2
07/01/20	0.1	L300	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: protective order.	Pretium Packaging	JM	77.5	2.2
07/02/20	0.5	L210	Review opposition to motion to strike; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	78.0	53.4
07/05/20	0.8	L210	Review and revise reply ISO motion to strike; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	78.8	54.2
07/06/20	0.1	L210	E-mail MJK re: reply brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	78.9	54.3
07/06/20	0.5	L210	Review and finalize reply brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	79.4	54.8
07/17/20	0.6	L210	Review order granting motion to strike; e-mail RD re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	80.0	55.4
08/05/20	0.2	L110	Read and respond to e-mail re: call from client.	Pretium Packaging	JM	80.2	1.7
08/24/20	0.3	L120	Confer with Benjamin Haber ("BH") re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	80.5	3.3
08/24/20	0.2	L120	E-mails to BH re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	80.7	3.5
08/26/20	0.2	L120	Confer with BH re: depositions.	Pretium Packaging	JM	80.9	3.7
08/27/20	0.2	L160	E-mails re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	81.1	0.4
09/01/20	0.3	L120	Confer with BH re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	81.4	4
09/01/20	0.3	L120	E-mails with BH re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	81.7	4.3
09/14/20	0.4	L300	Review file to prepare for conference call with OC re: discovery and mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	82.1	2.6
09/14/20	0.3	L300	Conference call with OC re: discovery and mediation	Pretium Packaging	JM	82.4	2.9
09/21/20	0.3	L120	Confer with BH re: discovery.	Pretium Packaging	JM	82.7	4.6
09/23/20	0.3	L120	Confer with BH re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	83.0	4.9
09/23/20	0.2	L160	E-mails re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	83.2	0.6
09/28/20	0.3	L120	Confer with BH re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	83.5	5.2

09/29/20	0.6	L200	Review and revise stipulation; e-mails re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	84.1	15.9
10/05/20	0.3	L120	Confer with BH re: case status.	Pretium Packaging	JM	84.4	5.5
11/06/20	1.8	L310	Review documents produced for mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	86.2	3.9
12/02/20	0.5	L160	Review additional documents produced for mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	86.7	1.1
12/02/20	0.2	L120	Confer with BH re: additional document production.	Pretium Packaging	JM	86.9	5.7
12/02/20	0.3	L160	Conference call with OC re: mediation data.	Pretium Packaging	JM	87.2	1.4
12/03/20	0.3	L160	Call with expert re: mediation data.	Pretium Packaging	JM	87.5	1.7
12/03/20	5.5	L160	Draft mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	93.0	7.2
12/07/20	6.8	L160	Review additional documents produced for mediation and work on mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	99.8	14
12/08/20	0.3	L160	Call with expert re: mediation data.	Pretium Packaging	JM	100.1	14.3
12/09/20	0.5	L160	Review expert's report; e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	100.6	14.8
12/09/20	0.5	L160	Confer with BH re: mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	101.1	15.3
12/10/20	0.8	L110	E-mail Bobby Saadian ("BS") re mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	101.9	2.5
12/10/20	0.5	L160	Confer with BH re: mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	102.4	15.8
12/10/20	3.8	L160	Revise mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	106.2	19.6
12/10/20	0.5	L120	Confer with BS re: mediation strategy.	Pretium Packaging	JM	106.7	6.2
12/11/20	2.6	L160	Finalize mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	109.3	22.2
12/11/20	0.2	L160	E-mail BH re: mediation brief.	Pretium Packaging	JM	109.5	22.4
12/14/20	1.2	L310	Review additional documents produced for mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	110.7	5.1
12/15/20	1.0	L310	Review additional documents produced for mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	111.7	6.1
12/15/20	2.5	L160	Review file to prepare for mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	114.2	24.9
12/15/20	0.5	L120	Confer with BH re: case strategy.	Pretium Packaging	JM	114.7	6.7
12/16/20	4.5	L160	Mediation	Pretium Packaging	JM	119.2	29.4
12/16/20	0.1	L160	E-mail BS re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	JM	119.3	29.5
12/16/20	0.3	L160	Review and revise MOU; e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	119.6	29.8
12/22/20	0.1	L160	Read and respond to e-mail from OC: re settlement agreement.	Pretium Packaging	JM	119.7	29.9
12/28/20	3.3	L160	Draft settlement agreement and related documents; e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	123.0	33.2
01/20/21	0.4	L210	E-mail instructions to BH re: motion for preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	123.4	55.8
02/03/21	1.7	L210	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval; e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	125.1	57.5
02/03/21	0.3	L210	E-mail BH re: proposed order.	Pretium Packaging	JM	125.4	57.8
02/03/21	0.2	L210	E-mail LATLC re: declaration ISO cy pres recipient.	Pretium Packaging	JM	125.6	58
02/04/21	0.2	L210	Review LATLC's declaration; e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	125.8	58.2
02/04/21	0.5	L210	Review updated motion for preliminary approval; e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	126.3	58.7
02/11/21	0.3	L210	Review OC's edits to motion for preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	126.6	59
02/11/21	0.2	L160	Confer with BH re: OC's edits to motion for preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	126.8	33.4
03/11/21	1.0	L210	Review file to prepare for hearing on motion for preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	127.8	60
03/12/21	1.0	L210	Prepare for hearing on motion for preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	128.8	61
03/12/21	0.5	L210	Hearing on motion for preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	129.3	61.5
03/12/21	0.2	L120	Confer with BH re: hearing.	Pretium Packaging	JM	129.5	6.9
03/18/21	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: hearing.	Pretium Packaging	JM	129.6	16
03/18/21	1.5	L200	Review ruling on motion for preliminary approval; e-mail OC re: class notice and fee motion issues.	Pretium Packaging	JM	131.1	17.5
03/18/21	0.2	L200	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: ruling.	Pretium Packaging	JM	131.3	17.7

03/22/21	2.7	L210	Revise class notice and prepare joint reponse to order granting preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	134.0	64.2
03/23/21	0.5	L200	Review and revise notice and joint response; e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	134.5	18.2
03/24/21	0.1	L200	Read and respond to e-mail re: call from client.	Pretium Packaging	JM	134.6	18.3
03/24/21	0.6	L210	Review OC's edits to notice and joint response; e-mail OC re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	135.2	64.8
03/24/21	0.2	L210	E-mail instructions to MJK re: filing joint response.	Pretium Packaging	JM	135.4	65
04/02/21	0.3	L210	E-mail administrator re: order granting preliminary approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	135.7	65.3
04/05/21	0.6	L210	Read and respond to e-mails re: administration deadlines.	Pretium Packaging	JM	136.3	65.9
04/15/21	0.2	L210	Read and respond to e-mails re: settlement website.	Pretium Packaging	JM	136.5	66.1
04/26/21	0.4	L210	Review preliminary calculations and e-mail administrator re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	136.9	66.5
05/12/21	0.2	L210	E-mail RD re: fee motion.	Pretium Packaging	JM	137.1	66.7
05/12/21	0.3	L210	Confer with BH re: motion for attorney's fees and final approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	137.4	67
05/12/21	0.2	L210	E-mail BH re: motion for attorney's fees and final approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	137.6	67.2
05/17/21	0.2	L210	Read and respond to e-mail re: call from class member.	Pretium Packaging	JM	137.8	67.4
05/17/21	0.1	L210	E-mail administrator re: class member's new address.	Pretium Packaging	JM	137.9	67.5
05/17/21	0.2	L210	Confer with Ronghua Guan ("RG") re motion for attorney's fees and final approval; e-mail re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	138.1	67.7
05/17/21	0.2	L210	E-mails with RG re: motion for attorney's fees.	Pretium Packaging	JM	138.3	67.9
05/17/21	0.1	L210	E-mail re: class member's new address.	Pretium Packaging	JM	138.4	68
05/18/21	0.2	L210	Review administrator's report and send e-mail re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	138.6	68.2
05/18/21	0.2	L120	Confer with BH re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	138.8	7.1
05/24/21	0.2	L210	Confer with administrator re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	139.0	68.4
05/24/21	0.1	L210	Read and respond to e-mail from OC re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	139.1	68.5
05/25/21	0.1	L210	E-mail MJK re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	139.2	68.6
05/25/21	0.1	L210	Review script re: undeliverable notices and e-mail BH re: same.	Pretium Packaging	JM	139.3	68.7
05/25/21	0.2	L210	E-mail OC re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	139.5	68.9
05/25/21	0.2	L120	Confer with BH re: motion for attorney's fees and final approval.	Pretium Packaging	JM	139.7	7.3
06/01/21	2.0	L210	Review and edit motion for attorney's fees and related documents.	Pretium Packaging	JM	141.7	70.9
06/01/21	0.2	L120	Coner with BH re: undeliverable notices.	Pretium Packaging	JM	141.9	7.5
06/01/21	0.3	L160	Confer with BH re: motion for attorney's fees.	Pretium Packaging	JM	142.2	33.7
06/01/21	3.5	L210	Review and edit motion for attorney's fees and related documents.	Pretium Packaging	JM	145.7	74.4

CONFIDENTIAL and WORK PRODUCT - ROBERT DART TIMESHEETS

Date:	Hours:	Task Code	Description	Case	Atty	Case Total:	Task Code Cumulative Total
3/11/2020	4.5	L210	research re: proper standard for affirmative defenses and applicable means of striking them.	Pretium Packaging	RD	4.5	4.5
3/12/2020	0.1	L210	drafted meet and confer email re motion to strike affirmatve defenses in answer	Pretium Packaging	RD	4.6	4.6
5/11/2020	5.5	L200	prep for meet and confer call, draft outline, edit outline	Pretium Packaging	RD	10.1	5.5
5/12/2020	0.4	L200	meet and confer call with opposing counsel re motion to strike affirmative defenses in answer	Pretium Packaging	RD	10.5	5.9
5/12/2020	0.3	L200	follow up email to opposing counsel	Pretium Packaging	RD	10.8	6.2
5/14/2020	6.5	L210	drafted motion to strike affirmative defenses in complaint	Pretium Packaging	RD	17.3	11.1
5/15/2020	0.5	L210	draft stipulation and proposed order re: leave to amend to file amended answer, email with opposing counsel re stip and order, edit stip and order	Pretium Packaging	RD	17.8	11.6
6/1/2020	0.2	L200	drafted meet and confer email re motion to strike affirmatve defenses in amended answer	Pretium Packaging	RD	18.0	6.4
6/1/2020	0.3	L200	email exchange with opposing counsel re: propriety of moving to strike affirmative defenses in amended answer.	Pretium Packaging	RD	18.3	6.7
6/2/2020	0.1	L200	further email exchange with opposing counsel re: propriety of moving to strike affirmative defenses in amended answer.	Pretium Packaging	RD	18.4	6.8
6/2/2020	0.1	L200	further email exchange with opposing counsel re: propriety of moving to strike affirmative defenses in amended answer.	Pretium Packaging	RD	18.5	6.9
6/9/2020	0.3	L200	meet and confer call with opposing counsel re: motion to strike affirmative defenses in amended answer	Pretium Packaging	RD	18.8	7.2
6/10/2020	0.3	L200	email with Justin F. Marquez ("JFM") re: which defenses we can plausibly strike	Pretium Packaging	RD	19.1	7.5
6/11/2020	2.7	L210	drafted motion to strike affirmative defenses in amended complaint	Pretium Packaging	RD	21.8	14.3
6/12/2020	1.4	L210	drafted motion to strike affirmative defenses in amended complaint	Pretium Packaging	RD	23.2	15.7
6/15/2020	1.5	L210	reviewed and edited motion to strike affirmative defenses in amended complaint, drafted proposed order	Pretium Packaging	RD	24.7	17.2
7/3/2020	2	L210	drafted declaration of Robert Dart to be filed in Support of Motion to Strike Affirmative Defenses in Amended Complaint.	Pretium Packaging	RD	26.7	19.2
7/3/2020	5.1	L210	drafted reply ISO Mot. to Strike Affirmative Defenses in Amended Complaint	Pretium Packaging	RD	31.8	24.3
2/4/2021	0.2	L210	drafted bio for JFM's declaration	Pretium Packaging	RD	32.0	24.5

CONFIDENTIAL and WORK PRODUCT - BENJAMIN HABER TIMESHEETS

Date:	Hours:	Task Code	Description	Case	Atty	Case Total:	Task Code Cumulative Total
08/24/20	1.5	L120	Confer with Justin Marquez ("JM") re: case history; review case file	Pretium Packaging	BH	1.5	1.5
08/26/20	0.2	L300	E-mail opposing counsel ("OC") re: discovery documents	Pretium Packaging	BH	1.7	0.2
08/26/20	1.2	L300	Draft PMK deposition notice and assist with scheduling	Pretium Packaging	BH	2.9	1.4
08/27/20	0.2	L160	E-mails with OC re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	BH	3.1	0.2
09/01/20	0.3	L120	Confer with JM re: case status	Pretium Packaging	BH	3.4	1.8
09/01/20	0.2	L160	E-mail with OC re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	BH	3.6	0.4
09/01/20	0.5	L120	Confer with JM re: case status; e-mails to JM re: case status	Pretium Packaging	BH	4.1	2.3
09/08/20	0.1	L160	E-mail with OC re: mediation.	Pretium Packaging	BH	4.2	0.5
09/09/20	0.3	L160	E-mail with JM re: mediation; e-mail to OC re: mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	4.5	0.8
09/14/20	1.2	L300	Prepare for and conduct conference call with OC re: discovery & mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	5.7	2.6
09/21/20	0.3	L120	Confer with JM re: discovery	Pretium Packaging	BH	6.0	2.6
09/21/20	0.2	L300	E-mail with OC re: depositions	Pretium Packaging	BH	6.2	2.8
09/23/20	0.1	L300	Follow-up e-mail with OC re: depositions	Pretium Packaging	BH	6.3	2.9
09/23/20	0.5	L160	Confer with JM re: mediation and case status; e-mail to OC re: mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	6.8	1.3
09/24/20	0.2	L160	E-mail with OC re: depositions and mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	7.0	1.5
09/28/20	0.4	L120	Review Order and confer with JM re: case status	Pretium Packaging	BH	7.4	3
09/29/20	2.5	L210	Draft and finalize joint stip; confer with JM re: same; send to OC	Pretium Packaging	BH	9.9	2.5
09/30/20	0.2	L210	E-mail with OC re: joint stip and mediation date to include in stip	Pretium Packaging	BH	10.1	2.7
10/01/20	0.8	L210	E-mails with OC re: joint stip, proposed order, and mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	10.9	3.5
10/01/20	0.7	L210	Draft and finalize proposed order	Pretium Packaging	BH	11.6	4.2
10/05/20	0.3	L120	Review Order and Confer with JM re: case status	Pretium Packaging	BH	11.9	3.3
10/09/20	0.2	L300	E-mail with OC re: depositions and discovery	Pretium Packaging	BH	12.1	3.1
10/16/20	0.1	L300	Follow up e-mail with OC re: depositions and discovery	Pretium Packaging	BH	12.2	3.2
11/06/20	0.2	L300	E-mail with OC re: discovery	Pretium Packaging	BH	12.4	3.4
11/06/20	2	L300	Review of documents produced	Pretium Packaging	BH	14.4	5.4
11/24/20	0.2	L160	E-mail with OC re: outstanding documents for mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	14.6	1.7
12/01/20	1.5	L160	Call to OC re: mediation; various e-mails to OC re: mediation and documents	Pretium Packaging	BH	16.1	3.2
12/02/20	0.6	L160	Prepare for and conduct conference call with OC re: discovery & mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	16.7	3.8
12/02/20	1	L160	Review records provided by OC; confer with JM re: records	Pretium Packaging	BH	17.7	4.8
12/03/20	1	L160	Call and various e-mails to expert re: records/analysis	Pretium Packaging	BH	18.7	5.8
12/07/20	1.2	L310	Review records provided by OC for mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	19.9	1.2
12/07/20	0.2	L160	E-mail to OC re: records	Pretium Packaging	BH	20.1	6
12/08/20	0.8	L160	Confer with JM and expert re: mediation records; e-mail exchange with opposing counsel re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	20.9	6.8
12/08/20	0.1	L160	E-mail to OC re: records	Pretium Packaging	BH	21.0	6.9

12/09/20	0.5	L160	Confer with JM re: mediation brief and expert's preliminary analysis	Pretium Packaging	BH	21.5	7.4
12/09/20	0.3	L160	E-mail to mediation re: brief	Pretium Packaging	BH	21.8	7.7
12/09/20	1.5	L160	Review mediation data/records; draft report	Pretium Packaging	BH	23.3	9.2
12/10/20	0.3	L120	Call with client re: case and mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	23.6	3.6
12/10/20	0.5	L160	Confer with JM re: mediation data/brief	Pretium Packaging	BH	24.1	9.7
12/10/20	6	L160	Research, analyze records, and draft mediation brief	Pretium Packaging	BH	30.1	15.7
12/11/20	4	L160	Draft and finalize mediation brief; prepare exhibits; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	34.1	19.7
12/11/20	0.2	L160	E-mail to Oc re: mediation/records	Pretium Packaging	BH	34.3	19.9
12/14/20	1.5	L310	Review additional records provided by OC for mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	35.8	2.7
12/14/20	0.3	L160	E-mail additional records to expert; confer with expert re: records.	Pretium Packaging	BH	36.1	20.2
12/15/20	1.4	L310	Review new documents provided by OC; review expert's updated analysis	Pretium Packaging	BH	37.5	4.1
12/15/20	0.5	L160	Confer with JM re: mediation and updated analysis	Pretium Packaging	BH	38.0	20.7
12/16/20	8	L160	Prepare for mediation; mediation; draft MOU following mediation; e-mails re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	46.0	28.7
12/16/20	0.3	L120	Call with client re: case and mediation	Pretium Packaging	BH	46.3	3.9
12/17/20	0.5	L160	Review OC's edits to MOU; Confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	46.8	29.2
12/18/20	0.2	L160	Call with client re: settlement	Pretium Packaging	BH	47.0	29.4
12/28/20	7	L160	Draft settlement agreement, proposed class notice, proposed order; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	54.0	36.4
12/28/20	0.2	L160	E-mail exchange with OC re: settlement papers	Pretium Packaging	BH	54.2	36.6
01/28/21	1.2	L160	Review changes to settlement papers; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	55.4	37.8
01/28/21	0.2	L160	E-mails with OC re: settlement papers	Pretium Packaging	BH	55.6	38
02/03/21	7	L210	Draft motion for preliminary approval ("MPA"), declaration, and other supporting documents; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	62.6	11.2
02/04/21	2.5	L210	Finalize MPA and supporting documents/exhibits; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	65.1	13.7
02/04/21	0.6	L210	Various e-mails with OC re: settlement papers and hearing dates	Pretium Packaging	BH	65.7	14.3
2/11/2021	0.8	L210	Review edits from OC re: MPA from opposing counsel; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	66.5	15.1
2/11/2021	0.3	L210	E-mail OC re: MPA	Pretium Packaging	BH	66.8	15.4
2/12/2021	1.5	L210	Finalize MPA and supporting documents for filing	Pretium Packaging	BH	68.3	16.9
3/11/2021	1	L210	Review MPA and supporting documents in advance of hearing	Pretium Packaging	BH	69.3	17.9
3/12/2021	2	L210	Prepare for and attend hearing on MPA; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	71.3	19.9
3/24/2021	0.2	L120	Call with client re: case status; memorialize notes	Pretium Packaging	BH	71.5	4.1
4/26/2021	0.5	L160	Review settlement administration's preliminary calculations; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	72.0	38.5
4/19/2021	0.2	L160	Call with client; memorialize notes	Pretium Packaging	BH	72.2	38.7
5/4/2021	0.4	L160	Call with client; memorialize notes	Pretium Packaging	BH	72.6	39.1
5/18/2021	0.2	L120	Confer with JM re: undeliverables of class notice	Pretium Packaging	BH	72.8	4.3
5/21/2021	0.3	L210	Confer with Ronghua Guan ("RG") re: Motion for Attorneys' Fees.	Pretium Packaging	BH	73.1	20.2
5/25/2021	2	L110	Draft script for calls re: undeliverables; train staff on script; confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	75.1	2
5/26/2021	0.5	L120	Various interal e-mails re: undeliverables	Pretium Packaging	BH	75.6	4.8
6/1/2021	0.5	L120	Meet with staff re: undeliverables; e-mail updated addresses to settlement administrator and OC	Pretium Packaging	BH	76.1	5.3
6/1/2021	0.5	L210	Review Motion for Attorneys' Fees; Confer with JM re: same	Pretium Packaging	BH	76.6	20.7

CONFIDENTIAL and WORK PRODUCT - RONGHUA GUAN TIMESHEETS FOR MORENO V. PRETIUM

Date:	Hours:	Task Code	Description	Case	Atty	Case total:	Task Code Cumulative Total
05/18/21	6.9	L210	Prepare Memorandum of Law in Support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees (8	Pretium Packaging	RG	6.9	6.9
05/21/21	8.6	L210	pages), Marquez's Declaration in Support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees (6 pages);	Pretium Packaging	RG	15.5	15.5
05/23/21	7.9	L210	Prepare Memorandum of Law in Support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees (7 pages); Marquez's declaration in Support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees (13 pages); proposed order granting motion for attorneys' fees (4 pages);	Pretium Packaging	RG	23.4	23.4

CONFIDENTIAL and WORK PRODUCT - RACHEL J. VINSON TIMESHEETS

Date:	Hours:	Task Code	Description	Case	Atty	Case total:	Task Code
06/15/20	4.9	L390	Draft meet and confer letter re deficient discovery responses, read discovery, review documents produced	Pretium Packaging	RJV	4.9	4.9
07/07/20	0.1	L100	Review protective order	Pretium Packaging	RJV	5.0	0.1
07/15/20	0.2	L100	Review Notice of Appearance	Pretium Packaging	RJV	5.2	0.3
07/17/20	0.2	L100	Review order re motion to strike	Pretium Packaging	RJV	5.4	0.5
10/06/20	0.2	L100	Review joint 26 report	Pretium Packaging	RJV	5.6	0.7
12/11/20	0.2	L100	Review mediation brief and correspondence	Pretium Packaging	RJV	5.8	0.9

CONFIDENTIAL and WORK PRODUCT - MIN JEE KIM TIMESHEETS

Date:	Hours:	Task Code	Description	Case	Atty	Case total:	Task Code
11/26/19	0.2	L190	Mailed out PAGA Letter to the company and the registered agent	Pretium Packaging	MJK	0.2	0.2
11/26/19	0.5	L190	Drafted initial case filing documents, finalized and filed the complaint and the initial case documents	Pretium Packaging	MJK	0.7	0.7
12/08/20	0.1	L190	Received document production from OPC. Saved Time Records (PRETIUM-0004471 - 4479) to file and circulated to team.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	0.8	0.8
12/09/20	0.1	L190	Emailed team to remind mediation brief is due today and to confirm that we're submitting it today. JM confirmed that it will be submitted either tomorrow or Friday. Updated mediation brief deadline to Friday.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	0.9	0.9
12/11/20	0.6	L190	Finalized mediation brief and submitted it to the mediator via email. Saved to file and attached it to the calendar entry	Pretium Packaging	MJK	1.5	1.5
12/14/20	0.1	L190	Received Def Supp Doc - Time Records (PRETIUM-004480 - 5127). Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	1.6	1.6
12/15/20	0.1	L190	Received Def Supp Doc - Time Records (PRETIUM-005128 - 7518). Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	1.7	1.7
12/15/20	0.1	L190	Per BH's instructions emailed Jarrett the document production received from OPC	Pretium Packaging	MJK	1.8	1.8
12/15/20	0.1	L190	Received Def Supp Doc - Time Records (PRETIUM-007519 - 8380). Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	1.9	1.9
12/18/20	0.1	L190	Sent the MOU to the client via Docusign. Keep running into issues and emailed BH to confirm email	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.0	2
12/21/20	0.1	L190	Checked the status of the MOU sent to the client via docusign and responded to BH	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.1	2.1
12/21/20	0.1	L190	Emailed MOU to Caldepo requesting it to be translated from English to Spanish per JM's request.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.2	2.2
12/21/20	0.2	L190	Received client's signed MOU. Saved to file and emailed it to BH. Per BH's instructions, signed JM's signature and emailed it to OPC	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.4	2.4
12/22/20	0.1	L190	Received spanish version of the MOU from Caldepo. Saved to file and emailed it to JM/BH.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.5	2.5
12/22/20	0.1	L190	Received invoice for translating the MOU to Spanish. Saved to file and processed with accounting.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.6	2.6
12/31/20	0.2	L190	Went into the case on litify, when through the information that was filled in through the data dump, and make edits and added details to fields that were missing.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.8	0.2
01/02/20	0.1	L190	Received Order Setting rule 26(f) Scheduling Conference & initial order. Calendared on outlook calendar and saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	2.9	0.3
01/03/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Notice of Initial Order. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	3.0	0.4
01/17/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Application of Non Resident Attorney to Appear Pro Hac Vice. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	3.1	0.5
01/17/20	0.2	L190	Received Def's Motion to Dismiss Plaintiff's Complaint. Saved to litify, calendared relevant deadlines and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	3.3	0.7
01/27/20	0.6	L190	Finalized and filed Plaintiff's Notice of Motion and Motion to Remand	Pretium Packaging	MJK	3.9	1.3

02/10/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Opposition to Motion to Remand. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	4.0	1.4
02/10/20	0.1	L190	Drafted and filed Notice of Appearance for Corey Kniss	Pretium Packaging	MJK	4.1	1.5
02/10/20	0.3	L190	Finalized and filed FAC	Pretium Packaging	MJK	4.4	1.8
02/14/20	0.2	L190	Finalized and filed Pltff's Reply to Def's Opposition to Motion to Remand	Pretium Packaging	MJK	4.6	2
02/24/20	0.2	L190	Finalized and filed Joint Scheduling Conference Report	Pretium Packaging	MJK	4.8	2.2
02/24/20	0.1	L190	Received Joint Stipulation for Extension of time for Def to respond to Pltff's FAC. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	4.9	2.3
02/28/20	0.1	L190	Drafted and filed Notice of Withdrawal for Corey Kniss	Pretium Packaging	MJK	5.0	2.4
03/06/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Notice of Motion and Motion to Strike Allegations in Pltff's FAC. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	5.1	2.5
03/06/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Answer to FAC. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	5.2	2.6
03/09/20	0.7	L190	Received Scheduling Conference Minute Order. Calendared all relevant deadlines regarding trial as stated in the order. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	5.9	3.3
03/09/20	0.1	L190	Received Order Regarding Motion to Remand. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	6.0	3.4
03/11/20	0.8	L190	Received Scheduling Order. Confirmed with the dates we already had calendared. Added/revised deadlines based on the order. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	6.8	3.4
03/16/20	0.1	L190	Drafted and filed a Notice of Appearance for Robert Dart	Pretium Packaging	MJK	6.9	3.5
03/16/20	0.1	L190	Received Joint Stipulation to Continue Hearing on Def's Motion to Strike & later the Order Granting Joint Stipulation to Continue Hearing on Def's Motion to Strike. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	7.0	3.6
03/17/20	2.0	L300	Called client to see if he could provide names of witnesses, drafted Plaintiff's Initial Disclosures and emailed Nicol and Justin for review	Pretium Packaging	MJK	9.0	2
03/19/20	0.5	L210	Revised, finalized, and served Plaintiff's Initial Disclosures to OPC via email	Pretium Packaging	MJK	9.5	0.5
03/23/20	1.2	L310	Drafted Plaintiff's RPF1 & SROGS1 and emailed NH for review	Pretium Packaging	MJK	10.7	1.2
03/30/20	0.1	L190	Followed up with Nicol regarding Pltff's RFP1 & SROGS1 drafts I sent her for review.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	10.8	3.7
03/31/20	0.2	L310	Finalized RFP1 & SROGS1 revisions made by NH and emailed it to JM for final review	Pretium Packaging	MJK	11.0	1.4
04/06/20	0.2	L190	Went through my emails/NEF orders received to confirm the hearing scheduled for today re Def's Motion to Strike Allegations in Pltff's FAC was continued. Updated calendar entry and informed NH that it was continued to 5/4/2020	Pretium Packaging	MJK	11.2	3.9
04/07/20	0.3	L190	Finalized Pltff's RFP1 & SROGS1 and served to OPC via email. Calendared Def's response deadline on Clio and Outlook calendar	Pretium Packaging	MJK	11.5	3.7
04/07/20	0.1	L190	Emailed JM, NH & RD a reminder email that our Deadline to file Opposition to Def's Motion to Strike Allegations in Pltff's FAC is Monday, 4/13/2020	Pretium Packaging	MJK	11.6	4
04/10/20	0.1	L190	JM filed a Joint Stipulation re Motion to Strike and SAC. Saved conformed to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	11.7	4.1
04/13/20	0.4	L190	Received Order re Joint Stipulation to file SAC and vacate hearing. Circulated to team, saved to file, updated calendar (calendared def's answer deadline to SAC & removed Def's MTS FAC Hearing and Opposition/ Reply due dates), on Clio & outlook calendar	Pretium Packaging	MJK	12.1	4.5

04/27/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Answer to SAC. Saved to file and circulated to JM/NH/RD	Pretium Packaging	MJK	12.2	4.6
04/29/20	0.1	L190	Updated calendar entry on outlook and Clio for discovery extension given to OPC to respond to Pltff's discovery, set 1	Pretium Packaging	MJK	12.3	4.7
05/22/20	0.4	L190	Went through our calendar and added Rachel to all entries on calendar	Pretium Packaging	MJK	12.7	5.1
06/01/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Amended Answer to SAC. Saved to file and circulated it to JM/NH/RD/RV.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	12.8	5.2
06/08/20	0.1	L190	Re-named and saved Def's responses to Pltff's SROGS1 & RFP1 and Def's Doc produced with a draft of the protective order.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	12.9	5.3
06/29/20	0.2	L190	Received Def's Opposition to Motion to Strike. Downloaded and saved to file, and emailed it to JM/NH/RD/RV	Pretium Packaging	MJK	13.1	5.5
07/01/20	0.4	L190	Organized the entire file. Renamed all documents that are not in the right format and organized all documents in the right folder	Pretium Packaging	MJK	13.5	5.9
07/02/20	0.1	L190	Checked the docket online to make sure all hearings are calendared.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	13.6	6
07/02/20	0.1	L190	Received [proposed] stipulated protective order. Saved to file and circulated the hyperlink of the document to JM/NH/RV.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	13.7	6.1
08/05/20	0.2	L190	Receivied messgae from Stephanie and Linda stating that the client called wanting and update. Talked to RV and then also emailed JM/NH/RV asking what I need to tell the client. Emailed Melina asking her to call the client as he's a spanish speaker	Pretium Packaging	MJK	13.9	6.3
08/25/20	0.5	L310	Requested a PMK template from Krik and drafted/incorporated our information into the notice and emailed it to BH/JM.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	14.4	0.5
08/25/20	0.7	L190	Registered for a new pacer account for BH, updated his account to next gen, drafted, finalized and filed the notice of appearnce, and emailed it to JM/BH.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	15.1	7
09/25/20	0.1	L190	Received Order of the Chief Judge. Saved to file and circulated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	15.2	7.1
10/01/20	0.7	L190	Finalized and filed Stipulation to Continue Case Management Dates and Deadlines	Pretium Packaging	MJK	15.9	7.8
10/03/20	0.1	L190	Received Order Granting Case Management Dates. Saved to file and ciruclated to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	16.0	7.9
10/05/20	0.5	L190	Received Mediation Notice for Mediation with Peter Litchman. Calendared all relevant deadlines, saved everything to file, & processed fee with accounting.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	16.5	8.4
11/06/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Supplemental Production of Documents. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	16.6	8.5
12/02/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Supplemental Production of Documents. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	16.7	8.6
12/03/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Supplemental Production of Documents. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	16.8	8.7
12/08/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Supplemental Production of Documents. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	16.9	8.8
12/11/20	0.5	L190	Finalized and submitted mediation brief to mediator	Pretium Packaging	MJK	17.4	9.3
12/14/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Supplemental Production of Documents. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	17.5	9.4
12/15/20	0.1	L190	Received Def's Supplemental Production of Documents. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	17.6	9.5
12/18/20	0.1	L190	Obtained client's signautre on the MOU. Eamield team and saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	17.7	9.6
01/08/21	0.3	L190	Checked file to make sure each and every document was transferred into litify for both matters. Nothing was transferred so uploaded everything manually.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	18.0	9.9
02/04/21	0.1	L190	Received the signed Stipulation of Settlement from OPC. Emailed Andrea for help to explain to the client and get this signed.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	18.1	10

02/04/21	0.1	L190	Received confirmation from Andrea. Emailed the stipulation of settlement to the client via docuSign	Pretium Packaging	MJK	18.2	10.1
02/05/21	0.1	L190	Followed up with Andrea to see if she could follow up with the client regarding the docuSign as he reviewed it but still has not signed	Pretium Packaging	MJK	18.3	10.2
02/12/21	1	L190	Finalized and filed Motion for Preliminary Approval	Pretium Packaging	MJK	19.3	11.2
02/17/21	0.1	L190	Received confirmation from JM. Processed invoice from Berger Consulting with accounting. Saved to litify.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	19.4	11.3
02/23/21	0.2	L190	Received Notice of Settlement and it's exhibits from OPC. Saved to file.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	19.6	11.5
03/18/21	0.3	L190	Texted JM and had a call with BH regarding the submitting the MPA documents to LWDA. Saved the submission information to litify.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	19.9	11.8
03/24/21	0.1	L190	Received Order Granting Motion for Preliminary Approval fo Class Action Settlement. Saved to litify and circualted to team	Pretium Packaging	MJK	20.0	11.9
03/26/21	0.7	L190	Finalized and filed Joint Response to Order Granting Plaintiff's Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement and supporting docs	Pretium Packaging	MJK	20.7	12.6
04/02/21	0.1	L190	Received the Amended Order Granting Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement. Saved to file and circulated to team.	Pretium Packaging	MJK	20.8	12.7
04/16/21	0.2	L190	Complied all documents and emailed the the documents related to the Motion for Preliminary Approval and the SAC to the settlement administrator	Pretium Packaging	MJK	21.0	12.9